
Supply Bid Sheet SY 2019 20

Food Service Program

Suwannee County School District

Item Specifications  Warrior Catko
1 Aluminum Foil Heavy Duty, 18"x25" roll 25.96$               25.65$               

2 Aluminum Foil squares 9"x10" 500/box 47.91$               7.90$                 

3 Film wrap clear plastic 18"x2000' roll 16.13$               13.76$               

4

5 Liners, Bake Sheet 16"x35" 1000/cs No Bid 32.60$               

6 Liners, Pan Saver 100/box No Bid 25.90$               

7
Gloves, disposable heavy plastic wrist length 

medium& Xt Large 500/box 4.61$                 1.99$                 

8 Gloves Powderless S,M,L,XL 35.38$               2.39$                 

9
Gloves, Disposable tough vinyl, seamless, tight fitting 

fits either hand NO powder s-Xl 26.46$               6.98$                 

10 Bowls, salad foam round 12 oz 53.56$               20.90$               

11 Containers 8 oz 1000/case 38.71$               14.75$               

12 Cups/Lids, 4oz 2500/case No Bid 37.50$               

13 Cups, foam 8oz cold drink 1000/case 23.98$               17.85$               

14 Cups, foam 16 oz cold drink 1000/case No Bid 17.58$               

15 Cups, Souffle 2oz 5000/case 23.57$               23.90$               

16 Cups, Souffle 4oz 5000/case 37.04$               37.50$               

17 Cups/Lids, 8oz squat 500/case No Bid 14.75$               

18 Cups/Lids, 12oz squat 500/case No Bid 18.95$               

19 Food tray (french fries) paper, 8oz 1000/pk 18.33$               16.10$               

20 Forks, Medium plastic 1000/case 7.57$                 5.90$                 

21 GENPAK 3 comp snapit tray (#NS203) 19.53$               19.40$               

22 Knives 1000/case 7.47$                 5.90$                 

23

24 Lids, clear, to fit 16 oz Code #10 1000/case No Bid 15.50$               

25 Lids, clear plastic 12oz drinking cup 1000/cs 18.62$               15.50$               

26 Napkin (dispen) 7.25"x13.5" 40pks of 250/cs 28.24$               27.60$               



27 Plates 6" foam 1000/cs 17.84$               21.25$               

28 Plates 9" foam divided 3 compartment 500/cs 18.23$               19.88$               

29 Plates, 3 compartment 500/case No Bid 19.88$               

30 Spoons 1000/cs 7.04$                 5.90$                 

31 Sporks 1000/cs No Bid 13.75$               

32
Tray hinged lid, foam 8x71/2x3/34,3 compartment  

200/cs 18.20$               22.50$               

33
Pebble Plate School Tray 22st-8, black- 5 

compartment,240/cs No Bid 19.20$               

34 Tray, food(French fr) paper 4 oz 1000/pk 12.32$               29.80$               

35
Tray, sandwich clear plastic, hinged lid 3"x6"x3" 

500/cs 51.04$               52.00$               

36 All Purpose Cleaner No Bid 19.80$               

37 Broom, Angle Stick No Bid 4.95$                 

38 Can liners 40-45 gal 1.6 Miln 100/cs 21.16$               28.60$               

39 Floor Cleaner No Bid 86.41$               

40 Germicidal Cleaner/All purpose 32.23$               30.75$               

41 Handles, wet mop JAW type 6.88$                 7.90$                 

42 Mop bucket with wringer 50.21$               54.00$               

43 Spray Bottles 2/triggers 1.22$                 0.99$                 

44 Toilet Bowl Cleaner No Bid 34.00$               

45 Toilet Bowl Mop 0.88$                 1.05$                 

46 Hand Soap Betco Clario 42.62$               53.96$               

47 Wet mop 24ozrayon banded 12/cs 2.74$                 3.25$                 

48 Roll Towels Wausau Ecosoft 800' natural No Bid 48.00$               

49

50

51

On the items that both company's bid on, Catko is slightly higher, however they bid on every item that we 
need.  Based on our past experience with Catko I recommend the award of Food Services Supplies to Catko 
Distributors, Inc


